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111/21
Apologies.

None.

112/21
Declarations of Interest.

None.
113/21
Dispensation Requests.

None.
114/21
Public Participation.


None.
115/21
Minutes of the Meeting Held on 13th September 2021.
Resolved that the Minutes of the Meeting held on the 13th September 2021, copies of which had been previously circulated to members, be signed by the Chairman as a true record.

116/21
Matters arising from the Minutes of the Meeting held on 13th September 2021.

None.
117/21
Accounts.
The Clerk submitted details of accounts due for payment, copies of which were circulated to members at the meeting, as set out below:
	Cheque
	Name
	
	
	
	Description
	
	
	
	
	
	Amount

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	BL0660
	Zurich Municipal
	Insurances            pd 30.9.21
	5,422.80

	BL0661
	Harborough Fire and Safety Ltd
	Annual Service for Fire Appliances
	85.00

	BL0662
	PKF Littlejohn LLP
	Audit
	480.00

	BL0663
	ESPO
	Toilet Rolls & Towels
	30.66

	BL0663
	ESPO
	Paper
	23.16

	BL0664
	Fleckney Village Cricket Club (JMG Amenity)
	Herbicide Treatment
	270.00

	BL0664
	Fleckney Village Cricket Club (JMG Amenity)
	Loam
	664.10

	BL0664
	Fleckney Village Cricket Club (Battersby Sports)
	Grass Seed
	169.00

	BL0665
	Community Heartbeat Trust
	Defibrillator accessories
	          46.80                                                                                        

	BL0666
	Guardian
	Gate Security
	309.70

	BL0667
	Regent Samsic
	Cleaning
	377.47

	BL0668
	RJ Fencing Ltd
	Allotment Path Edging
	2,861.05

	BL0669
	LRALC
	Training Course
	45.00

	BL0670
	Equals (HP Instant Ink)
	Ink Replacement Service
	3.49

	BL0670
	Equals (Screwfix)
	Toilet Repairs
	14.76

	BL0671
	Alison Ingram
	Fleckney Village Aid Telephone
	9.24

	BL0672
	Fleckney Baptist Church
	Youth Club
	150.00

	BL0673 – BL0676
	Various
	 Wages
	2658.74

	BL0677
	HMRC
	Tax & NI
	129.60

	BL0677
	HMRC
	Tax & NI
	14.32

	BL0677
	HMRC
	Tax & NI
	33.01

	BL0677
	HMRC
	Tax & NI
	58.40

	BL0677
	HMRC
	Tax & NI
	435.60

	BL0677
	HMRC
	Tax & NI
	48.57

	BL0677
	HMRC
	Tax & NI
	46.24

	DD13Sept
	Nat West Bank
	Bank Charges             pd 15.9.21
	27.20

	DD15 Sept
	British Gas
	Electricity                   pd 21.9.21
	218.89

	DD16 Sept
	British Gas
	Electricity                   pd 24.9.21
	11.64

	DD6 Sept
	British Gas
	Electricity                   pd 21.9.21
	12.96

	DD9Sept
	Nest
	Pension Contribution  pd 16.9.21
	29.17

	DD9Sept
	Nest
	Pension Contribution  pd 16.9.21
	38.89

	DD9Sept
	Nest
	Pension Contribution  pd 16.9.21
	65.99

	DD9Sept
	Nest
	Pension Contribution  pd 16.9.21
	87.99

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	Total
	
	£14,879.44

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	


The Clerk reported that the total receipts in September amounted to £75,962.15(Excluding VAT) which included the Precept receipt from Harborough DC of £71,575.
The Clerk submitted a Bank Reconciliation Statement at 30th September 2021.

The Clerk also submitted details of petty cash payments for the September quarter.

Resolved that:
(i) The accounts as set out above be approved for payment.
(ii) The information on receipts be received and noted.
(iii) The Bank Reconciliation Statement at 30th September 2021 be received and noted.
(iv) The details of petty cash payments for the September quarter be received and noted.

118/21   
District and County Councillors’ and Police Reports.
Members received a report from District Cllr. Bilbie giving details of a fly-tipping incident that had resulted in the offender being fined £4,500.  The report went on to say that the Tip-Off campaign had resulted in a significant reduction in fly-tipping in the district over the past two-years, bucking the national trend. 
There were no County Councillor or Police reports.

Resolved the report be received and noted.
119/21    Correspondence.
The Clerk submitted details of correspondence received since the last meeting as set out below:

	Ref No.
	Received From
	Contents
	Agreed  Action



	1
	CEE Bill Alliance
	Request fro support for the Climate and Ecological Emergency (CEE) Bill
	Full details to be circulated to members and the request to be considered at the next meeting. 

	2
	HCYC
	AGM Thursday 4th November 2021, 5pm to 6pm via Zoom
	Cllr. Mcdonagh to attend.

	3
	Rural Community Council
	AGM Monday 25th October 2021 at 11.30am at Hinckley
	Noted

	4
	Jack Edwards, Coach, Under 12s, Fleckney Athletic AFC
	Concern re allocation of slots on the All Weather Pitch to users from outside the Village and lack of support from the Parish Council for Village football teams
	The Chairman to respond to the issues raised pointing out that earlier slots were still available, the alternative of changing slots within the Club and explaining the work done by the Parish Council in supporting local football.

 


Resolved that the correspondence received be noted and the action set out in the above list be approved.
120/21
Employees and Chair’s Reports.
Members’ considered the report of the Street Orderly, copies of which had been previously circulated to members.
There was no report from the Chairman.
Resolved that the report of the Street Orderly be received and noted.
121/21
Recreation Committee.
Members received the minutes of the Recreation Committee that was held on 27th September 2021 copies of which had been previously circulated.
Resolved the minutes of the Recreation Committee be received and noted.
122/21
Human Resources Committee.
Members received the minutes of the Human Resources Committee that was held on 4th October 2021 copies of which had been previously circulated.
Resolved that the minutes of the Human Resources Committee be received and noted.

123/21
Planning Applications.
Members considered and commented on new planning applications received since the last meeting of the Council as follows:
	Reference
	Proposal
	Location
	Comment

	21/01662/FUL
	Erection of a single storey rear/side extension (revised scheme of 21/01013/FUL)  


	32 Victoria Street
	No comment.

	21/01726/PCD
	Discharge of Condition 11 (Construction Environmental Management Plan) of 18/00579/OUT 

	Land off Arnesby Road
	No comment

	 21/01755/PCD
	Discharge of Conditions 7 (Surface Water Drainage Scheme), 8 (Surface Water on site during construction), 9 (Maintenance of SUDS), and 10 (Infiltration Testing) of 18/00579/OUT 

	Land off Arnesby Road
	No comment

	21/01767/FUL
	Erection of a single storey front extension 

	19 Penclose Road
	No comment

	21/01795/FUL
	Dwelling with attached garage and swimming pool.
	Birdcage Cottage, Arnesby Road
	Object – Design/Scale/Massing. Development in the open countryside outside the limits to development as set out in the Neighbourhood Plan. 
Design inappropriate for entrance to village location and not in keeping with nearby properties. 


Resolved that the comments on planning applications as set out in the table above be forwarded by the Clerk to Harborough DC.

124/21
Lady Byron School.

The Clerk submitted a request from the Lady Byron School to use the Spinney at the Leicester Road Recreation Ground for ‘forestry classes’ for small groups of under ten students at any one time.

Resolved that the request be acceded to subject to details of the activities undertaken being provided together with a risk assessment and evidence of public liability insurance.

125/21
Freedom of Information Request.

The Clerk updated members with the latest situation with the Freedom of Information request regarding the payment of £299k authorised by the Joint Chief Executive to the Council’s leisure service contractor in April 2020.

Following the intervention by the Freedom of Information Commissioner’s Office a response had been received from Harborough DC which stated: 
‘Dear Requestor.

 

RE: Freedom of Information Request FOI21/230.
 

I have looked into the matter raised as part of the supplementary enquiries made around your original request. With regard to the matter pertaining to copies of minutes etc in relation to the specific decision making process in question, I can confirm that that there are no such minutes. In terms of providing a response under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I can confirm that the requested information is not held by the authority in terms of what constitutes ‘held’ information for the purposes of that information access legislation.  Although the authority is not obliged to provide any explanatory note regarding its actions, where this was not the subject matter of the request itself, I have provided the following by way of context.

 

Secondary Request:
A copy of any minute relating to the Council’s decision to financially support the two Harborough District Leisure Centres. (Paraphrased.)
 

Decision:
Information not held.
The decision was taken under emergency powers by the then Joint Chief Executive, as we were in a pandemic situation.

 

There was consultation with the Leader and the Deputy Leader, although this was technically not required. Authority to do so is enshrined under Part 3 C1.3 of the Councils Constitution, which is set out below.

 

‘In an emergency, if they consider it necessary in the interest of the efficient administration of the Council’s service, the Joint Chief Executive may exercise any of the powers or duties of any other Officer. Either of the Joint Chief Executives are also responsible for any Emergency Planning that needs to be undertaken, and the Council’s powers under section 138 of the Local Government Act 1972 to incur expenditure’
 

Outcome of Review:
· I acknowledge that the formal response was not actioned within the prescribed period and is in breach of s10 Freedom of Information Act 2000.
· The information is not held by the District Authority.
· Contextual information provided regarding the decision making process.
 

This email concludes all internal procedures regarding information access processes. In the event that you remain dissatisfied with the outcome of this review, you have the option of referring the matter to the Information Commissioner’s Office’

Members felt that the explanation that the decision was taken under the emergency powers contained in its Constitution was not justified by the nature of the decision which was commercially based and not about destruction of or danger to life or property that was imminent.
Members considered the alternatives for taking the matter further.

Resolved that an objection be submitted in the name of the Chairman (as a local elector) to the Harborough DC External Auditor in respect of the 2020/21 Accounts regarding the decision to award £299k to its leisure services contractor on the 24th April 2020 on the basis that the Joint Chief Executive did not have the necessary delegated powers and therefore the decision was ultra vires.
126/21
Review of Dog Bin Provision.
Members considered the adequacy of the dog bin provision in the Village particularly having regard to recent complaints about overflowing bins. Members were reluctant to increase the number of bins but felt that as the Village was expanding additional bins should be provided to serve the new estates. It was also felt an additional bin should be provided where footpath C8 meets Leicester Road.

Resolved that new dog bins be provided at the following locations:

(i) Leicester Road with its junction with footpath C8.
(ii) Saddington Road with its junction with footpath Z87
(iii) Coleman Road with its junction with footpath A41

127/21
External Audit Report and Certificate 2020/21.

The Clerk reported the receipt of the External Audit Report and Certificate 2020/21 copies of which had been previously circulated to members. 

The External Auditor Report 2020/21 stated:

 “On the basis of the review of Sections 1 and 2 of the Annual Governance and Accountability Return (AGAR), in our opinion the information in Sections 1 and 2 of the AGAR is in accordance with Proper Practices and no other matters have come to our attention giving cause for concern that relevant legislation and regulatory requirements have not been met. 

Other matters not affecting our opinion which we draw to the attention of the authority: None.”

External Audit Certificate 2021/20 stated:

 “We certify that we have completed our review of Sections 1 and 2 of the Annual Governance and Accountability Return, and discharged our responsibilities under the Local Audit and Accountability Act 2014, for the year ended 31 March 2021.” 
Resolved the report be received and noted.
128/21
New Sports Centre.

The Clerk provided members with the latest revisions to the design that had been provided by the Architect following the discussion that had taken place about the external appearance of the building. The two storey option had once again been dismissed due to the inefficient use of the floor space and the fact that the changing room façade remained at the front of the building. With this in mind the Architect had looked at alternative ground floor layouts instead but had still had not provided a CGI showing the external appearance. There was a feeling that the Architect had not fully grasped the expectation that the Council had for the external appearance of the building and what could be achieved by the use of different roof lines/angles to the various parts.

As the pre-planning application is not concerned with the final floor plan or detailed elevations it was felt that this element should proceed whilst further discussions take place about the floor plan, elevations and roof detail.

Resolved that:

(i) The pre-planning application proceeds on the basis of a single storey building based on the massing produced by the Architect.
(ii) The New Sports Centre Working Party meets to consider in detail the floor plan options and the requirements for the external appearance.
(iii) A meeting be arranged with Ball Hall and the Architects to discuss the way forward with the design. 

129/21
Date of Next Meeting.

Monday 8th November 2021 at 7.00 pm.
The Meeting closed at 9.02 pm.

Signed………………………………….Date……………….

Chairman
Fleckney Parish Council
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Present:
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